AUTHENTICATED
5 GOVERNMINT
INFORMATION

GPO,

H.R.83

One Aundred Thirceenth Congress
of the
Wnited States of America

AT THE SECOND SESSION

Begun and held at the City of Washington on Friday.
the third day of January, o thousand and fourteen

An Act

Making consolidated appropriations for the fiscal year ending September 30, 2015,
and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representalives of
the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Consolidated and Further Con-
tinuing Appropriations Act, 2015”.

SEC. 2. TABLE OF CONTENTS.
The table of contents of this Act is as follows:

Sec. 1. Short title.

Sec. 2. Table of contents.

Sec. 3. References,

Sec. 4. Explanatory statement.

Sec. 5. Statement of appropriations.

Sec. 6. Availability of funds.

See. 7. Technical allowance for estimating differences,
Sec. 8. Adjustments to compensation.

Sec. 9. Study of electric rates in the insular arens.
Sec. 10. Amendments to the Consolidated Natural Resources Act.
Sec. 11. Payments in lieu of taxes.

DIVISION A—AGRICULTURE, RURAL DEVELOPMENT, FOOD AND DRUG
ADMINISTRATION, AND RELATED AGENCIES APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2015

Title I—Agricultural Programs

Title II—Conservation Programs

Title III—Rural Development Programs

Title IV—Domestic Food Programs

Title V—TForeign Assistance and Related Programs

Title VI—Related Agency and Food and Drug Administration
Title VII—General Provisions

Title VIII—Ebola Response and Preparedness

DIVISION B—COMMERCE, JUSTICE, SCIENCE, AND RELATED AGENCIES
APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2015

Title [—Department of Commerce

Title [I—Department of Justice

Title III—Seience

Title IV—Related Agencies

Title V—General Provisions

Title VI—Travel Promotion, Enhancement, and Modernization Act of 2014
Title VII—Revitalize American Manufacturing and Innovation Act of 2014

DIVISION C—DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2015

Title I—Military Personnel

Title [1—Operation and Maintenance

Title I[II—Procurement

Title [V—Research, Development, Test and Evaluation
Title V—Revolving and Management Funds



H.R.83—319

. (4) the Chairperson shall encourage the use of grants to
improve and support community-based music performance and
education.

ARTS INDEMNITY LIMITATIONS

SEc. 416. Section 5 of the Arts and Artifacts Indemnity Act
(20 U.8.C. 974) is amended—

(1) in subsection (b)—

(A) by striking “$10,000,000,000" and inserting
“$15,000,000,0007; and

(B) by striking “$5,000,000,000" and inserting
“$7,500,000,000"; and
(2) in subsection (¢)—

(A) by striking “$1,200,000,000" and inserling
“$1,800,000,000”; and

(B) by striking “$750,000,000" and inserting
“$1,000,000,000",

STATUS OF BALANCES OF APPROPRIATIONS

SEC. 417, The Department of the Interior, the Environmental
Protection Agency, the Forest Service, and the Indian Health
Service shall provide the Committees on Appropriations of the
House of Representatives and Senate quarterly reports on the status
of balances of appropriations including all uncommitted, committed,
and unobligatmf?unds in each program and activity.

REPORT ON USE OF CLIMATE CHANGE FUNDS

Sec. 418. Not later than 120 days after the date on which
the President’s fiscal year 2016 budget request is submitted to
the Congress, the President shall submit a comprehensive report
to the Committees on Appropriations of the House of Representa-
tives and the Senate describing in detail all Federal agency funding,
domestic and international, for climate change programs, projects,
and activities in fiscal years 2014 and 2015, including an accounting
of funding by agency with each agency identifying climate change
programs, projects, and activities and associated costs by line item
as presented in the President’s Budget Appendix, and including
citations and linkages where practicable to each strategic plan
that is driving funding within each climate change program, project,
and activity listed in t%)e report.

PROHIBITION ON USE OF FUNDS

SEC. 419. Nolwithstanding any other provision of law, none
of the funds made available in this Act or any other Act may
be used to promulgate or implement any regulation requiring the
issuance of permits under title V of the Clean Air Act (42 U.S.C.
T661 et seq.) for carbon dioxide, nitrous oxide, water vapor, or
methane emissions resulting from biological processes associated
with livestock production.

GREENHOUSE GAS REPORTING RESTRICTIONS

SEC. 420. Notwithstanding any other provision of law, none
of the funds made available in this or any other Act may be



